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Programme Design and Approval 
  
6 Proposals for new apprenticeship programmes go through the University’s Programme 
Approval Process. Approval panels are additionally tasked with the responsibility to 
ensure that the delivery and assessment arrangements meet the apprenticeship standard 
and assessment plan. Panels are also required to ensure that the proposals meet ESFA 
funding rules, the requirements of the Ofsted Education Inspection Framework and the 
requirements of the Office for Students Registration Conditions. 
 
 
7 When a new standard which has an integrated End Point Assessment is submitted for 
Programme Approval (see 13-14 below), an application to the ESFA must also be 
submitted, to ensure that the University is on the Register of End Point Assessment 
Organisations. The programme will only be approved by the University if it meets all 
requirements of the EPAO. 
 
 
Monitoring of Programme Delivery 
 
8 Apprenticeships programmes are subject to the standard University programme 
approval, monitoring and periodic review requirements. Apprenticeships are also subject 
to ESFA funding requirements and Ofsted Education Inspection Framework 
requirements. 
 
9The University is committed through adherence to these processes, guidelines and 
reference points that it will: 

 
 
9.1 endeavour to maximise completion and progression rates and engagement with 
the programmes and apprenticeship training 
 
9.2 provide learners with a rewarding experience where they will be able to fulfil their 
potential 
 
9.3 engage inspiring, well-qualified and highly competent staff to deliver and assess 
learning 
 
9.4 provide a safe, productive, and supportive environment in which all learners will 
have equal access to learning opportunities, skills support and advice 

 learning
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Communication with Employers 
 
14 Apprenticeship staff communicate with employers in a number of ways. They include 
inviting employers to participate in tripartite review meetings, attendance at employer 
information groups quarterly, six monthly newsletters to update supervisors, supervisor 
training pre-start, supervisor training post induction, sharing monthly and quarterly reports 
with employers and the regular scheduling of monthly and quarterly meetings with 
designated account managers. 
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